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M Gmail Darryl Cotton <indagrodarryl@gmail.com>
Agreement
Larry Geraci <Larry@tfcsd.net> Wed, Nov 2, 2016 at 9:13 PM

To: Darryl Cotton <darryl@inda-gro.com>

No no problem at all
Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 2, 2016, at 6:55 PM, Darryl Cotton <darryl@inda-gro.com> wrote:

Hi Larry,

Thank you for meeting today. Since we executed the Purchase Agreement in your office for
the sale price of the property 1 just noticed the 10% equity position in the dispensary was not
language added into that document. | just want to make sure that we're not missing that
language in any final agreement as it is a factored element in my decision to sell the
property. I'll be fine if you would simply acknowledge that here in a reply.

Regards.

Darryl Cotton, President

darryl@inda-gro.com
www.inda-gro.com
Ph: 877.452.2244
Cell: 619.954.4447
Skype: dc.dalbercia

6176 Federal Blvd.
San Diego, CA. 92114
USA

NOTICE: The information contained in the above message is confidential information solely for the use of the
intended recipient. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, the reader is notified that any use,
dissemination, distribution or copying of this comymunication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify Inda-Gro immediately by telephone at 619.266.4004.
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